Pode Lo

SPECIAL ISSUE

Kenya Gazette Supplement No. 82 (Acts No. 8)

Q“Q)

REPUBLIC OF KENYA

KENYA GAZE TTE SUPPLEMENT

ACTS 2009

NAIROBI, 23rd December, 2009

CONTENT

Act—
PAGE

. The FInance Act, 2009..........civvereeesrereeeresosessesssssssesesseseeeeeesoes s 577

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NAIROBI




577
No 80f2009 |
| Date of Assent 22nd December, 2009
Date of Comnjtencemenlt: See Section I
An Act of Parllament to amend the law relatlng to various

taxes and dutles ‘and for matters incidental
thereto

ENACTED by the Parhament of Kenya, as follows -
PART I PRELIMINARY

| 1 Th1s Act may be 01ted as the Flnance Act 2009 and
shall come into operat:on or be deemed to have come into
Operatlon as follows— ST

(a) sect10ns2 4 5 6(a) 6(b) 6(e), 7 8 10 11
L 12,:13, 14 15 16,.18,:19, 21, 22(a), 22(c)
22(d), 23, 24, 25, 26 27 28, 30(a) and 65,

‘ "__‘_Jon the 12th June 2009; :

14

(b) sectlon 66, on the Ist July 2009

(c) sectlons 6(c) 6(d) and 14(a)(11) on the 26‘*‘ |
November 2009; .

(d) sections 3,9,17,20 22(b) 29, 30(b), 30(c),
‘304, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40,
41, 42, 43 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52,
53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64,
- 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74 and 75, on the
1st January, 2010.

Short title and
commencement.

I M ) e T AT R AT T I, 1 e

B e



; ﬂ,,, - ‘

S _ 578 .
: _NO. 8 o Finance 2009
BT o PART I1 - CUSTOMS AND EXCISE
';‘:{,‘:;’O"n“;;’gﬁ o 2. Section 90 of the Customs and Excise Act is
Cap472. . amended -
(@)  in subsection (2), by deleting the words “industrial
use” appearing in paragraph (b) and substituting
therefor the words “packing and packaging”;
(b) by inserting a new subsection irmnedia'tely after
subsection (2) as follows - o
(2A): The licences required under subsection
(2) shall be valjd for a renewable period of one |
year, - , 5
Amendment of 3. Section 91A of the Customs and Excise Act is
:f:;'_g';;m " amended In subsection (1) by deleting the words “tw,
hundred mullilitres or Jegg” and substituting therefor the
words “less than two hundred and fifty millilitres”. {
Repeal of 4. The Customs and Excise Act is ‘amended by
?:;{0:7;_26“\ of repealing section 126A. -
Amendment of 3. The Fourth Schedule to the Customs and Excise Act
g::: ;:, ¢ to Is amended by renumbering the existing Fourth Schedule ag
Cap. 472. Part | and inserting a new Part [ as follows-
PART II

“Part I shall not apply to exports to Export
Processing Zones”




579
2009 ' ' F mance

6, The Flfth Schedule to the Customs and Exeise Act
is amended-—. PR

(a) .in the manner speclﬁed in paragraph 1 of the
| Flrst Schedule to this Act

) "--'m the manner spec1ﬁed in paragraph_ 2. of ‘the
- First Schedule to this Act; L

| (e')rt._, ‘m the manner spec1f1ed in paragraph 2A of the
8 ,‘A‘Fll'St Schedule to thlS Act . |

. (d) in the manner spec1ﬁed in paragraph 2B of the

L '_‘Flrst Schedule to this Act;.

| (e) " in the manner specrﬁed in paragraph 3 of the

Flrst Sehedule to,this Act

PART III VALUE ADDED TAX

7. Secnon 2, of the Value Added Tax Act is arnended
by inserting the following new deﬁmhon 1n proper
alphabetical sequence -

. “transrt goods means goods 1rnported from a
" foreign place, ‘through. the terrrtory of Kenya, to a
foreign destination. |

8. Sect1on 9 of the Value Added Tax. Act 1s" amended in
subsection (1) by deleting subparagraph (c)(i) and
substituting, th_erefor the followmg new subparagraph -

(i) the amouni of duty of customs, if any, paid on
t,thosc. gOOdS ;. .

~ . Amendment of

No. 8.

Fifth Schedule
to Cap. 472.

Arnendment of
section 2 of
Cap. 476.

Amendment of
section 9 of
Cap. 476.



No. 8

Amendment of
section 12 of
Cap. 476.

Amendment of
section 19A of
Cap. 476.

Amendment of
section 23 of
Cap.476

580
Finance 2009

9. Section 12 of the Value Added Tax Act is amended
in subsection (1) by deleting the words “thirty days” and
substituting therefor the words “three months”.

10. Section 19A of the Value Added Tax Act is
amended by inserting a new subsection 1mmed1ately after
subsection (2) as follows —

(2A) A person withholding tax under subsection (2)
shall issue a withholding tax certificate to the supplier
at the time of making the payment for the supplies.

11. Section 23 of the Value Added Tax Act is
amended in subsection (3) by deleting paragraph (b) and
substituting therefor the following new subsection -

(b) taxable goods for emergency relief purposes
for use in specific areas and within a specified
period, imported or purchased locally by the
Government or its approved agent, a non-
governmental organization or a relief agency
authorized by the Minister responmble for disaster
management, where -

(i) the goods are for use in areas where a
natural disaster or calamity has occurred
in Kenya; or

(if) the goods are intended for use in officially
recognized refugee camps in Kenya;

(iii) the goods are household utensils, food
stuffs, materials for provision of shelter or
equipment and materials for health,
sanitary or educational purposes; and,




_ . 581
2009 - Finance No. 8

(1v) in. the case. of  a natural disaster or
calamity, the 1mportat10n or purchase:
 locally is made within six months or such
further period, .. not  exceeding twelve
.,_months as. the Comrmssmner may perrmt
in each case:, | ‘ |

' Provided that the gbdds imported or purchased
under this paragraph shall be of such quantltles and subject
to such limitations as the Comnussroner may lmpose

12. The Second;Schedule to the,Value. Added‘Tax Act Amendment of

is amended by inserting the following tariff number and g’l;f;z;’e"fo
- description in proper numerical order:- Cap. 476.

Tariff No. Tariff Description.
. 8517.12.00 . -Telephones: . : for cellular
- - networks or for other wireless. " -
networks SR =

| 13 The Thlrd Schedule to the Value Added Tax Act Amendment of

the Third
is amended Schedule to

Cap. 476.
(a) by deletmg paragraph 1 and substltutmg therefor

- the following new paragraph .
1. The followmg ﬁnanc1a1 servrces -
(a) the operatron of current deposit or

savings accounts, including the
provision of account statements;




v No. 8

582
Finance 2009

(b) the issue, transfer, receipt or any other
“dealing with money, including money
transfer services, and accepting over
the counter payments of household
bills, but excluding the services of
carriage of cash, restocking of cash
machines, sorting or counting of
money, ~ ‘ :

() issuing of credit and debit cards;

(d) automated teller machine transactions,

excluding the supply of automated
teller machines and the software to run
it;

(e) telegraphic money transfer services;

(f) foreign®  exchange transactions,
including the supply of foreign drafts
and international money orders;”

(g) cheque handling, processing, clearing
and settlement, including special
clearance or cancellation of cheques;

(h) the making of any advances or the
granting of any credit;




2009

583

"Finance

'(1) issuance of - securities for money,

1nclud1ng bills © "of  exchange,
promxssory notes money and postal
orders;

(j) the provision of guarantees, letters of

~credit and acceptance and other forms’

of documentary credit;

(k) the issue, transfer, receipt or any other
dealing with bonds, ‘debentures,
‘treasury’ bills and other forms of
sec’_u'rity or secondary security;

(1) the a551gmnent of a debt for

o con51derat10n

(m)the management of a umt trust or

7 collective” mvestment scheme
reglstered by the" Capltal Markets
" Authority and managed by the trustees
‘of the scheme; =~ -

. (n) credit ratlng bureau services provided

by a credit-agency registered by the
| Capl‘tal_lMar‘ket_ Authority;

(o) the p'ro'vi‘VSion' of the above financial
services on behalf of another on a
commission basis.

No. 8

1




584
S Flnance 2009
(b) hl pxlrugruph 10, by renumbering the existing

zpm_vhlmn a3 subparagraph (1) and inserting a new
*mbmamgruph as follows -

Snlc ut bulldmgs

A'“°“""’°"‘.‘_‘;-'_ .- 14 The F Fi.ﬂh Suhndulc. to the Value Added Tax Act is
the Fifth g d d & 4

Schedule to amen "" ® :.. EEATTE A

Cap. 476.

(a) in Part A-- o
: (1) “in the manner set out in paragraphs
I, 2and 3 of the Second Schedule
to this Act

(11) in the ma.rmer set out in paragraph 4
of the Second Schedule to this Act.

(b) in Part B, in the manner spe;ciﬁed in the Second
Schedule to this Act; |

(¢) inPartC-

(i) by deleting the word “other” appearing at
the beginning of item 9;

(ii) by inserting the words “parts of” at the
beginning of item 17.

f;mes“d'“‘t’:t of 15. The Seventh Schedule to the Value Added Tax Act
e deven .

Schedule to is amended -

Cap. 476.

(a) in paragraph 1, by deleting the words “or
within fourteen days of the completion
thereof” appearing in subparagraph (a);




385
2009 Finance
-(b) in paragraph 10(1) ,by. inserting the words
“at the time of making the payments to the
- supplier” immediately after the word
“Regulations” appe;aring ‘in subparagraph

O |
PART IV — INCOME TAX
16. Section 2 of the Income Tax Act is amended -

() by inserting the following new definition in
. proper alphabetical sequence + - - - :

“telecommunication operator” means
- . a.person licensed as.such under the Kenya
P

No.2 of 1998. Information - and. - Communications:: Act;

1998;"

" (iiy by deleting the definition of “training fee” and
... substituting . therefor " the .. following S New .

- . . definition—

“training fee” means a payment made
in respect of a business or user. training
services designed to improve the work

- practices and efficiency of an organization,
and includes. any payment in respect of
incidental. costs - associated: with the
provision of such services. -

17. Sectioh_: 4 of the Income Tax A¢t1 is amended by
inserting the following proviso at the end of paragraph (b) -

No. 8

Amendment of
section 2 of
Cap.470.

Amendment of
section 4 of -
Cap.470.




No. 8

Amendment of
section 4A of
Cap.470,

Amendment of
section 7A of
Cap.470.

Amendment of
section 8 of
Cap.470,

586
Finance 2009

“Provided that in computing the total income
of a partnership, there shall be deducted the cost
of medical expenses or medical insurance cover
paid by the partnership for the benefit of any
partner, subject to a limit of one million shillings
per year.

18. Section 4A of the Income Tax Act is amended in
subsection (4) by inserting the following new definition
immediately after the definition of “company” -

“all [oans” shall have the meaning assigned
in section 16(3)

19. Section 7A of the Income Tax Act is amended by
deleting subsection 3(c).

20. Section 8 of the Income Tax Act is amended -

(a) in subsection (4), by deleting the words “one
hundred and eighty thousand” and substituting
therefor the words “three hundred thousand™;

(b) in subsection (5) by -

(i) deleting the words “four hundred and eighty
thousand” appearing in paragraph (a) and
substituting therefor the words “six hundred
thousand’;

(ii) deleting the words “forty eight thousand”
appearing in subparagraph (b)(i) and
substituting therefor the words “sixty
thousand”;




587
2009 Finance

- (iii) deleting  the words *“four hundred and

eighty thousand shillings” appearing in
subparagraph - (b)(ii)’ and substituting
therefor the words “six hundred thousand”;

(iv) deleting the words “four hundred and
eighty thousand shillings or the first forty-
eight thousand shillings” appearing in
subparagraph  (c)(i)’ and  substituting
therefor the words “six hundred thousand
shillings or the first sixty thousand
shlllmgs o

(V) deletmg the words “four hundred and
eighty” appearmé in- paragraph  (d) and
substituting therefor the  words “six
hundred” I

21. Section 10 .of the Income Tax:Act is amended in .

paragraph (d) by deletmg the words “in Kenya”.
22, Sectlon 15 of the Income Tax Act is amended-
(a) in subsection (2) -
(i) by deleting the words “but excluding the
National Social Security Fund” appearing
in paragraph (o); '

(i) by inserting a new paragraph immediately
after paragraph (x)as follows —

No. 8

Amendment of
section 10 of
Cap 470,

Amendment of
section 15 of
Cap.470.

..
e A 5 (LT £ e e Pk
gt < i b P

Y




No. 8

588

Finance 2009

(y) expenditure of a capital nature
incurred in the purchase or acquisition
of an indefeasible right to use a fibre
optic cable by a telecommunication
operator, provided the amount of
deduction shall be limited to five per
cent per annum.

(b) in subsection (3), by inserting the following new
paragraph immediately after paragraph (f) —

(g) in the case of a business which is a
sole proprietorship, the cost of medical
expenses or medical insurance cover
incurred. for the benefit of the
proprietor, subject to a limit of one
million shillings per year.

(c)- in subsection (4) —

(1)

by deleting the words “for the next
succeeding year of income” appearing

in the introductory portion and

substituting therefor the words *“for

- that year and the next four succeeding

(i1)

years of income”’;

by deleting the words “subsequent
years” appearing in paragraph (ii) of
the proviso and substituting therefor
the-. words “next succeeding four
years”; |




589
2009 - Finance | No.8
- (iii) by adding a new subparagraph in the
' proviso immediately ~ after
“subparagraph (iii) 'as follows-

(iv) Any deficit incurred by a
person as at 1%, January, 2010
shall be deemed to have been
“incutred in that year of income.

(d) by inserting the following new subsection
1mmed1ately after subsectlon (4)

(4A) Notw1thstand1ng subsectlon (4) the
Minister may, on-the recommendation of
the Commissioner, extend the period of
- deduction beyond five years where a person -
" applies through the- Commissioner for such
~extension, giving- evidence of inability to
E 'extmgulsh the deﬁ01t w1thm that period.

23. Sectlon 16 of the Income Tax Act is amended by Amendment of
section 16 of

deletmg subsectlon 2(1,) - | Cap.470.
24. Sectlon 19 of the Income Tax Act is amended - Amendment of
section 19 of
Cap.470.

(a) in’ subsectlon (5, by deletmg paragraph
(a) and substituting therefor the following
new paragraph -

| (a) the amount of actuarial surplus, as
determined under: the: Insurance Act
and recommended by the actuary to be
transferred from the life fund for the
benefit of shareholders;




590
No. 8 Finance 2009

(b) in subsection (5A) by deleting the proviso
and substituting therefor the following
new pProviso -

Provided that the amount of negative
transfer shall be limited to the actuarial
surplus recommended by the actuary to
be transferred from the life fund for the
benefit of shareholders in previous
years of income.

(¢) in subsection (6), by deléting paragraph (a)
and substituting. therefor the following
new paragraph -

(a) the same proportion of the amount
of actuarial surplus recommended by
the actuary to be transferred to the
shareholders as. the actuarial liability
in respect of its long term insurance
business in Kenya bears to the
actuarial liability in respect of its total
long term insurance business; and

(d) in subsection (6A), by deleting the proviso
and substituting therefor the following new
proviso -.

Provided that the amount of negative
transfers shall be limited to the amount of
actuarial surplus recommended by the
actuary to be transferred from the life fund
for the benefit of the shareholders in the
previous years on income.

Sl St o SIS e IS 1)

Bt e e s

=N




591
2009 Finance No. 8

~ 25. Section 35 of the Income Tax Act is amended in  Amendment of
subsection (1), by deleting paragraph (a) and substituting ::e:}t;?;; 6’,.5 of

therefor the following new paragraph -

(a) a management or professmnal fee or training fee
except —

(i) a commission paid to a non-resident agent
in respect of. flowers, fruits-or vegetables
exported from Kenya and auctioned in any
market outside Kenya and audit fees for
analysis of maximum residue limits paid to
a non-resident laboratory or auditor; or

(i) a commission paid. by ‘a resident air

- transport operator to a non-resident agent in
order to secure. tickets. for international
travel. . I

©26. The Income Tax: Act'is amended by repeahng Ré‘:?a"é,’;A ]
section L O

section 39A. _ Cap.470. i

27, Section 72 of the Income Tax Act is amended in Amendment of
section 72 of

subsection (1), by 'deleting the words “for each period of Cap.470,
twelve months or part thereof during which the failure

continues” appearing in paragraph (a). -
28. The Income Tax Act is amended by inserting the  Insertion of

section 75A in
followmg new section lmmedlately after section 75 ~ Cap 470.

SRS S A T g At iy [ e £ Vs

Assessment in . T5A. (1) Notwithstanding any other

certain eases.  orovision - of  this - Act, where the
Commissioner has reason to believe that any
tax payable by any person is at risk of non-
payment -

R Pl TN e AT A b il e
T e



592
No. 8 : Finance 2009
(a) due to the imminent-depm'ture
of the person from Kenya; or

(b) where the person, being a
company, is about to be
liquidated or otherwisé wound
up or cease business;

the Commissioner may, whether or not the
due date for the payment of that tax has
arrived, by notice in writing served on that
person require’ that person to pay the tax
within the time specified in the notice.

(2) Any person who fails to pay tax
when required to do so under subsection (1)

shall be guilty of an offence.
fs\meﬂgm?nt of 29. The Second Schedule to the Income Tax Act is
econd , :
Schedule to amended —
Cap.470.

(a)- in paragraph 1 -

(i) by inserting_‘ the following new sub-
paragraph immediately after subparagraph
(D(e)-

(cc) in a case referred to in paragraph
1(1)(a) for the year of income
commencing on or after 1% January,
2010, ten per cent;

;
&
i

Fw

. '.];

._.
£,
[ R



593

2009 F inance | -No. 8 ;
| (D) by 1nsertmg the following . new sub- o |

‘ paragraph 1mmed1ately af’ter subparagraph |

(W o

“(dd) 1n a case referred to in paragraph . ;

5(1)(e) for ‘the year of income
_ commencing: on or after 1St January, \
2010 ﬁfty per cent o | !

(m) by 1nsert1ng * the: followmg ‘new sub-
paragraph 1mrned1ately aﬁer subparagraph |

(1)(6)—- =

TR t‘(ee) m a case referred to in paragraph : e tl
st Sy or S(D(E) for any yearof

" 'income’ commencing - on, or. after A
r"‘f,‘January 2010;7 where ; roads,; _power, o
;f",’fwater sewer* and other ‘soclal - h
B -71nfrastructure “have been prov1ded R |
| twenty ﬁve per cent'."-.-': S B T

(b) in paragrapH 5 by deletlng subparagraph (1)(e) o
©rand” substltutrng therefor the followmg new. -k
subparagraph—--'--' Y AR - ;

A '(e) a burldlng in use as a hostel oran
‘"‘"‘f-':_"'.“_educatronal building ",or a ‘building in
- -usé for training, provided such building
" has been certified by the ‘Commissioner
S for the purposes of this paragraph |

S S
e T LT e Nl B RS

P B T S R P L R 3 P T T T P I P R




| 594
No. 8 Finance 2009
| (c) in paragraph' >(5)(1'), by “inserting a new

subparagraph immediately after subparagraph (H
as follows -

‘(f_f)“a wbuildi_n-g.in‘ use as a commercial
building other than a building referred
- to in subparagraph (1)(f);

(d) * in paragraph (7), by inserting the following new
subparagraph. immediately after subparagraph (3)

—_—

(4) For telecommumcatlon equlpment

- purchased and. used by a telecommunication

~ operator, other than machinery specified under

. subparagraph . (3)(d), the amount of wear and

-tear for a year of income shall be.twenty per
cent of 'the amount Qf expenditure incurred. .

(e) in paragraph 24 S

(i)“ by , 1nsert1ng h :'fo‘llo‘wing new
: subparagraphs : 1mrned1ately after
subparagraph l(e) -

(f) on the construcnon of a building
- or purchase and installation of
T maghincry outside the City of -

.. Nairobi. or the- Municipalities. of |
Mombasa or Kisumu whereof the
value of the investment is not less
than two hundred million shillings;

R N R B A S S s e i



A R wethg agn

T T A T B L s YL, WA e

2009

(i)

. subparagraph (f)” immediately after the -~

(in)

. expression’ - . “subparagraph:

iv)

595
Finance No. 8

(g) on the purchase of filming
equipment by a local film producer

licensed by the Minister responsible

for matters:  relating to

communication;

by ‘inserting' the following new
subparagraphs ~ immediately after
subparagraph (2)b) -

(c) in the case of an investment

referred to in subparagraph (1) (f),
. be equal to one hundred and fifty
percent of the capital expenditure;

(d) in the case of the equipment

. freferred to in subparagraph (1)(g),

~ be equal to one hundred percent of

~ the capital expenditure,
by inserting the words “or the building -~ =~

or  machinery referred  to  in

' ' ey
 APpearing in subparagraph (1), <

in Subparag'faph;'_ (3)(e); by’ msertmgllm |

words “or the- transformation” ahd
distribution of electricity through: the ~ ..
national grid” immediately after' the:
words “supply to the national “grid”
appearing in the definition of the word
“manufacture”.



596
No. 8 Finance 2009
(ee) in paragraph 26, by deleting the
. expression “paragraph 24(1)(a) or (c)” and
substituting.  therefor the expression
“paragraph 24(1) (a), (c) or (£);”

(f) by inserting new parégraphs immediately after

paragraph 31 as follows-

31A. Where a person incurs capital
expenditure under a concessionairing
arrangement, the deduction shall be spread
and claimed in equal portions over the
perid’d of the‘co'nc_ession, provided that the
period of the concession shall be deemed to
commence in the year in which the
machinery is first put into use.

31B. Subject to this Schedule, where a person
incurs capital expenditure on the purchase or
acquisition of the right to the use of a computer
software, there shall be deducted, in computing
his gains or profits for the year of income in
which the software is first used and for
subsequent years of income, an amount equal
to one-fifth of that expenditure.

f;mffrf;:!!?lent of 30.The Third Schedule to the Income Tax Act is
the ir ‘ : ' '

Schedule to iended in paragraph S -

Cap.470.

R NRLTE R




S - 597 (
2009 . S Fmauce o No. 8

(a) by inserting a new subparagraph 1mmed1ately after_
subparagraph (b)(ii) as‘fo_llows -

~ (iii) bearer bonds. with a maturity of ten
years and above, ten percent .of the gross
amount payable

(b) by deletmg the words “and provxded that tax has
not been deducted under section 37" appearing in
" subparagraph (d)(l)

: (C)'-f‘by deletlng the words and prov1ded that tax has
. 'not been deducted: under sectlon 37 appearing in
IR subparagraph (d)(n)

IR

PART v - MIS'CELLANii‘;OLU»Sj

.JOA Sectlon 2 ot the Nat10nal Assembly Remuneratlon Amendment of
Act is amended in subsectlon 2)- . C section 2 of Cap 5.

(a) bY delenng Pal‘agraph (a) and subs’ntu‘nnU therefor
the following new paragraph - | |

(a) the persons for the time being holding the

~ “several. offices specified in the first column

- of Part Il of the First Schedule shall receive a

- sitting. allowance at the rates respectively

~ specified in the second. column - of  that

Schedule in respect of every meéting
attended; . B -

= e L e oy e N - e i i L LT ¢ amek e mine WESELL TS e AT P aen o e
<R TR b G e T i b enid ki o e R R R ST €

(b) by deleting the proviso,



No. 8
Amendment

of section 2 of
Cap. 27.

Amendment
of section 49
of Cap. 27.

Amendmeht
of section 52
of Cap. 27.

598
Finance 2009

31. The Bills of Exchange Act is amended in section 2 by
inserting the following new definitions in proper alphabetical

sequence-

Cap. 488.

Cap. 491.

“bank” has the meaning assigned in
section 2 of the Banking Act;

“Central Bank” means the Central Bank
of Kenya established under section 3 of
the Central Bank of Kenya Act;

“cheque truncation” means a system of
cheque clearing and settlement between
banks based on electronic data or images
or both electronic data and images,
without the conventional physical
exchange of instruments;

“Minister” means the Minister for the
time being responsible for matters
relating to finance.

32.Section 49 of the Bills of Exchange Act is amended by
inserting the following new paragraph immediately after

paragraph (f)—

(ff) where a cheque has been presented in accordance
with section 74A, the presentment of an image return
document, as defined under section 74B(5), to the
drawer or endorser, shall be deemed to be sufficient
notice of dishonor.

33.Section 52 of the Bills of Exchange Act is amended by
inserting the following subsection immediately after subsection

(4)-

BT i o A SR




599
2009 Finance

(5) Subsection (4) shall not apply in relation to-

(a)  presenting a cheque for payment under
section 74A; or

(b) a cheque which is paid following
~ presentment under section 74A.

34.Section 74A of the Bills of Exchange Act is amended in
subsection (6) by deleting the word “Authority” appearing in
paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the words “Central
Bank”. |

'35, Section 74B of the Bills of Exchange Act is amended in
subsection (5) by deleting the words “rules of the clearing
house” and substituting therefor the words “Central Bank under
section 74C”. - B

36.The Bills of Exchange Act is amended by inserting the
following new section immediately after section 74 B-

Regulations.. 74C. The Central Bank may make such
| regulations as may be necessary or expedient for
‘giving effect to the provisions of this Act in
respect of any matter or thing relating to cheque

truncation.

37. 'Kenya Airports Authority Act is amended by inserting
the following new section immediately after section 17 -

No. _8

.Amendment
of section
74A of Cap.
27.

Amendment
of section 74B
of Cap. 27.

Insertion of
section 74C
in Cap. 27,

Insertion of
sections 17A
and 17B in

- Cap. 395,

Establishment of 17A. There is established a Fund to be known-
Fund. ~as the Kenya ~Airports  Authority Fund
|  (hereinafter referred to as “the Fund”).

Sources of Fund. 17B. There shall be paid into the Fund —

gt

L ARG T
o At e o T

SR e o e iy ST

b




No. 8

Payments out of
the Fund,

600 o
Finance _ 2009

(a) all proceeds from the

charge collected, under

the Air Passenger

Cap.475. Service Charge Act;
(b) any monies
appropriated by

Parliament” for the
_purposes’ .~ of  the
Authority;

(c) the rates, charges, dues,
or_fees levied. by the
Authority under this
Act; .

(d) such sums as may be
payable. to, the
Authority pursuant to
this Act or any other
written law, . or
pursuant to any gift or
trust; and

(e) ali_ moneys from any

other sources provided -

- for or donated or lent
~ to the Authority.

17C. There shall be paid out of the Fund any
expenditure incurred by the Authority in the

exercise of its powers or the performance of its

functions under this Act.

T I o ST TN | IR R 7 e

F P S e e




601
2009 Finance

"38.Section 6 of the Trafﬁc Act is amended in subsectlon

(1A) by deleting the proviso and substltutmg therefor .the ofsection 6 of

following new provxso —

Provxded that a commercial vehlcle WhJCh requires
| lnspectlon shall be inspected and registered within thirty
, days of release by the customs.

39. Section 9 of the Traffic Act is amended —
(a) by deletiag subsection (2);

; (b)ln subsectlon (3),, by deleting the expressmn
“subsectlons (1) and (2)” and substituting therefor the
expressmn subsectlon (17

(c)‘ in sub'sec'tion" "(5) by deleting the expression
L “sabsectlon (1) (2).and (4)” and substituting therefor
L the expression “subsectlon (1) and (4)”.

40. Sectlon 98 of the Trafﬁc Act is amended in subsection
(4) by deleting the words “two years” and, substltutzng therefor
the words “one year”

41. Sectlon 10 of the Insurance (Motor Veh1cle Th1rd Party
- Risks) Act is amended by deletmg subsectlon (5).

42, The Air Passenger Service Charge Act is amended in
section 2, by inserting the following new deﬁmtlon in proper
alphabetlcal sequence —

“Kenya Revenue Authority” means the
Authority by that name established under
Cap.469 section 3 of the Kenya Revenue Authority Act.

No. 8
Amendment

Cap.403.

Amendment

of section 9 of

Cap.403,

‘Amendment

of section 98
of Cap.403,

Amendment
of section 10
of Cap 405.

Amendment

of section 2 of -

Cap 475.

R SRR R e R st b s

£y

R R

T

T T S P .
e N D A

o

R R

R e e A
B i L et i o
e T A ol E™ Y Ny

WG P S

T P R
- L

L T SR B




602
No. 8 Finance ' ' © 2009
Amendment 43.Section 5 of the Air Passenger Service Charge Act is
of section 5 of amended -
Cap 478. i
(a) in subsection (2), by deleting the word~*Government”
and substituting therefor the word “Commissioner”;
(b) in subsection (5), by deleting the word “Government”
and substituting therefor the word “Commissioner”.
Insertion of’ 44. The Air Passenger Service Charge Act is amended by
e SeHOm inserting the following section immediately after section 6 —
Cap.475.
_Cltlazge;gbe paid 6A. The Commissioner shall
into the Kenya . .
Airports Authority pay the charge colle.cted by
Fund. him under this Act into the
Kenya Airports Authority Fund
Cap. 395, established under the Kenya
Airports Authority Act, after
deducting the expenses of the
Kenya Revenue Authority for
the collection of the charge.
Amendment 45.Section 31 of the Capital Markets Act is amended in

of section 31 . . g '+ 3 .
of Cap.485A. subsection (1) by deleting the words “trade in appearing

immediately after the words “dealer shall” and substituting
therefor the words “transfer”.

Amendment 46. Section 23 of the Insurance Act is amended by inserting
g; ?:;'3’;72 > the following new subsections immediately after subsection (4) -

v ey r

AL




B

603
2009 Finance

(4A). No person shall -

(a) control, or be beneficially entitled, directly or
indirectly, to more than twenty-five per cent of
the listed share capital or voting rights of an
insurer; or

(b) be entitled to appoint more than twenty-five per
cent of the board of directors of an insurer; or

(c) be entitled to receive more than twenty-five
per cent of the aggregate dividends of an
insurer in any given financial year:

Provided that this subsection shall not apply to —

(i) a corporate entity licensed by an
insurance, banking, pensions or
securities regulator in Kenya; or

(i) a foreign corporate entity
licensed by an insurance,
banking, pensions or securities
regulator in it’s country of origin;
or

(ili) the Government of Kenya;

(iv) a state corporation within the
meaning of the State Corporations
Cap.446. Act.

(4B) No person shall be appointed as an executive director,
managing director, principal officer or other senior
management official of an insurer if such person-

No. 8

W et TR T T gt DY P N e Naa

T S T T T

Tt AR ST TN



604

No. 8 Finance 2009_

) controls, or is beneficially entitléd,
directly or indirectly, to more than twenty
per cent of the listed share capital or
voting rights of the insurer; or

(i)  is entitled to appoint: more than fwenty
per cent of the Board of Directors of the
insurer; or

(ii1) is entitled to receive more than twenty
per cent of the aggregate dividends of the
- insurer in any given financial year.

(4C) A person who, at the commencement of subsections
(4A) and (4B), holds any right, interest or office in an insurer
contrary to the provisions of those subsections, shall comply
with the requirements thereof by the 31 December, 2010.

Amendment 47, Sectibn: 41  of the Insﬁrance Act is amended in

g; g:;i_(;;; ! subsection (8) by deleting the proviso and substituting therefor
the following - .
Provided that —

(a) this subsection shall not apply to -

— e e ——— ol — it << b 8 e e 1 e e ee e
s



o 605
2009 Finance
() buildings’ and" other real property

. owned by the insurer Jomtly W1th any

- orgamsatlon

(). 1nvestments referred to in section
503); -

(iii)~ cash held by banks on behalf of the

 insurer in current - or - savirgs
accounts;  or- subject - to: sectlon
50(4)(g), ﬁxed dep031ts and

No. 8

(b mvestrnents of long term* insurance -

 business "or a general’ insurance business
ina company: or a.group. of compames
; whlch is a bank or a financial institution,
Sor ar group of - banks: or * financial

institutions’. shall; - pursuant to- sectlon. .

o 50(10) not exceed ten’ pereent

48.The Insurance Act is amended by 1nsert1ng anew sectlon
nnmedlately aﬁer sectlon 76 as follows—

Insurance  cover 76A Upon change of OWnershlp of a motor

upon change of i
ownership of motor VehICIe anlnsurer shall |

vehicle, - ' 3 :
| o (a) only i'sSue a temporary policy for a
~ period’ not: exceeding three months,.
- pending: the registration of the motor
vehicle in the name of the new owner;

Insertion of

section 76A

in Cap 487,

hinl v

g
B SR T St

»~ . N
T ST s et

AT iy

R

i e e b e b

e ST

Bt - ]

v Wea e e A amin
B T e e e el s i S A

il

A R A e S Ty A o T O

B P s e S Y

R TR e e

S ey oo ittt




606
No. 8 Finance 2009

(b) not renew the temporary cover or issue

. any new policy in respect of the motor
vehicle, unless the new owner” provides
proof of the registration of the motor
vehicle in his name by the Registrar of
Motor Vehicles.

Amendment 49,.Section 188 of the Insurance Act is amended in
of section 188 \hcection (2) by deleting the expression “30™ November” and

of Cap.487 VHE P M
substituting therefor the expression “30™ September”.

Amendment 50. Section 203 of the Insurance Act is amended in

g?g::;_‘;g.fm’ subsection (3).by deleting expression “(2)” appearing before the
words “a penalty equal to” and substituting therefor expression
Gt(l)’!. } .

Amendment 51. The First Schedule f_o the Insurance Act is amended in

gi:‘:fifl?:’:d paragraph 3 by deleting the -expression “(g)” appearing in

Cap.487. subparagraph (3) and substituting therefor the expression “(h)”.

Amendment 52. Section 2 of the Banking Act is amended -

of section 2 of

Cap.488.

(a) by inserting the following new definition in proper
alphabetical sequence — ' -
“agency” means an entity contracted by an
institution and approved by the Central Bank
- to provide the services of the institution on
behalf of the institution, in such manner as
may be prescribed by the Central Bank:




‘ 607

"‘_‘ 2009 " Finance

‘ - Provided that where such entity is a co-

: operatlve society, prior approval to provide
the services shall be sought from the Sacco

I ‘__-1*:'5;' Societies Regulatory Authority established
No.14 ofooog-" : under the SACCO Soc1et1es Act 2008.

| (b) in the dehmtlon of the word bank” by deletlng the
~ words* and 1nc1udes the Co-operatwe Bank of Kenya
Lunlted -

No.S |

(c) in: the dehnrtlon of branch’ by 'insertin-g_ the.-Word'_ |

permanent’ 1mmed1ately before the word
premrses C

(d) by 1nsertmg the followmg new deﬁmtlon in proper‘

- alphabencal sequence R

place of busmess rneans%{anjtprernises other than the
| .head office, including a branch; an agency or a ‘mobile

- unit, or such other premlses as may, from time to time,"

 be’ prescrlbed by the Central Bank, at which an
institution  transacts bankmg or financial business in
Kenya and which is open to the pubhc

53. Sectlon 3 of the Bankmg Act is amended in subsectlon
(1) by 1nsert1ng the -words  “or ‘a duly approved agency
conducting banking busmess on- behalf' of an institution”™
immediately after the word ‘institution” appeanng in para.craph

(a)-

54. Sectlon 12 of the Bankmg Act is amended -

(a) by deletlng the: words ‘In Kenya” appearmg in the .

introductory portion;

Amendment
of section 3 of
Cap.488.

Ame‘ndm.ent |
of section 12
of Cap.488.




No. 8

Amendment
of section 16
of Cap.488.

Amendment
of section 20
of Cap.488.

608
Finance , 2009

(b) in paragraph (b) -

(i) by deleting subparagrabh (il) of the
proviso and substituting therefor the
following new subparagraph —

(i1) a shareholding in any corporation
established for the purpose of
promoting development on Kenya
and approved by the Minister; or in a
foreign company which is licensed to
carry on the business of the institution
in its country of incorporation and
approved by the Central Bank;

(ii) by inserting a néw subpéragraph in the
proviso immediately after paragraph (ii)
as follows - :

(ii1) approval granted by the Central
Bank shall be subject to such
conditions as the Central Bank may
deem appropriate.

55. Section 16 of the Banking Act is amended in subsection
(1) by inserting the words “or a duly approved agency
conducting banking business on behalf of an institution”
immediately after the word “licence”.

56. Section 20 of the Banking Act is amended -

(a)  in subsection (1), by deleting the words “bad and
doubtful debts” and substituting therefor the
words “loans, advances and other assets”;

—_— ==



609

- Finance

‘in subsection (2), by deleting the words “bad
and doubtful debts” wherever they occur and

substituting therefor the words “loans, advances
and other assets?”. ' :

2009
(b)

- 57. Section 27 of the Banking Act is amended by inserting
the words “or their duly authorised agencies” after the word
“institutions” wherever it occurs. '

| 58. Section 28 of the Banking Act is amended in subsection

(1) by inserting the words “and their agencies” immediately after
the word “institutions” wherever it occurs. ‘ :

A 59.S_éction 31 of thé Ba.nking.Act is amended in subsection
(3)- . | -

(a) by inserting the words. © Isca];..or tax agency, fraud

.Investigations agency” immediately after the words

- “financial regulatory authority” appearing inl paragraph

(b) by inserting the following' proviso at the end of
paragraph (a) — \ :

Provided that the sharing of information with
- institutions outside Kenya shall only apply where
there is a reciprocal arrangement.

60. Section 32 of the Banking Act is amended in subsection
(1), by deleting. the words “institution and its” and. substituting
therefor the words “institution and its agencies and of their”.

61.Section 54 of the Banking Act is amended in paragraph
(c) by deleting the words “other than the Co-operative Bank of
Kenya”, |

No. 8

Amendimnent
of section 27
of Cap.488.

-Amendment
. of section 28
of Cap.488.

Amendment
of section 31
of Cap.488,

Amendment’
of section 32

of Cap.488.

Amendment
of section 54
of Cap.488.

S R LR e g

T

s el e B row

i A A e ik
AL L e L £ R T

ot T

LRI ST

P L

S i

T AP AP AP TSR P s IR £ o A

L R L Rt L M T LIV R T

s T e e
e e

iyl

TSN LT T S T S AT R S

T o ok R i 2, ar o 3 E g o i

ST e LR

P T et e S L 0 g

B LR S i e

T TR



610

No. 8 ~ Finance 2009
Amendment 62.Section 26 of the Central Bank of Kenya Act is amended
3?3:;3';12'6 by inserting the following proviso at the end of subsection (1) -

Provided that if, at any time, the Bank is unable tg
maintain the reserve of external assets required under
this subsection; it shall provide the Minister with a time-
bound remedial plan.

Repeal and 63. The Central Bank of Kenya Act is amended by repealing
;‘;‘;L?:;?f;;ll section 33L and replacing it with the following new section -
of Cap.491. : ‘ '
General penalty under  33F,, A person convicted of an offence under
Part. this Part for which no other penalty is
provided shall liable to a fine not exceeding
five hundred thousand shillings, or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding three
'~ years, or to both.
Insertion of 64. The Central Bank of Kenya Act is amended by inserting
?:cg:;_jgt the following new section immediately after section 56 -

General Penalty. S6A. A person convicted of an offence under
this Act for which no other penalty is provided
shall be liable to a fine not exceeding five
hundred  thousand  shillings, or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding three
years, or to both.

Amendment 65.The Kenya Post Office Savings Bank Act is amended in
OC';SP"'_C;';’;; °f section 4 by inserting a new paragraph immediately after
paragraph (f) as follows —

(ff) to deal in foreign exchange.




611
2009 Finance

06. The Foreign Investment Protection Act is amended by
inserting the following new section immediately after sectlon
SA -

Special 8B. (1) The Minister for Finance may, from
:’:::;?:::“t °Ftime to time, by notice in the Gazette declare
promotion  and that the arrangement specified in the notice,
protection. being arrangements made with the
Government of any country with a view to
promoting and protecting the investments of
that country in Kenya, shall have effect

according to its tenor.

(2) A notice under this section may be
amended or revoked by a subsequent notice
and an amendment or revoking notice may
contain such transitional provision or
termination date as the Minister may con51der

" necessary or expedient.

67.Section 2 of the Retirement Benefits Act is amended in
the definition of the word “actuary” by deleting the words
“recognized as such by” and substltutlng therefor the words
“who is a Fellow of”.

68.Section 37 of the Retirement Benefits Act is amended in
the proviso by deleting the expression “five million” and
substituting therefor the expression “one hundred million”.

69.Section 38 of the Retirement Benefits Act is amended in
subsection (1) by addmg the following immediately after

paragraph (c) -

of No. 3 of

No. 8

.
e 2 ooy v e e S
3 g e

e P T e B

Insertion of
section 8B in
Cap.518.

Wl
T

e e o
= ST

Amendment
of section 2 of
No. 3 of 1997.

Amendment
of section 37
of No. 3 of
1997,

Amendment
of section 38§

1997,




No. 8

Repeal and
replacement
" of section 18
of No 9 of
2001.

612
. Finance 2009

“or in the case of scheme funds. which comprise any
_statutory contnbuuons be placed in any investment other.
than. Government securitiés or 1nfrastructure bonds:
issued by publlc institutions”. : : |

"7_0,2The Coffee Act is amended_ by repealing section 18 and
replacing it with the following new section -

Kinds of 18. L1cences under sectlon 17 ahall be of the
licences. followmg kinds — '

() a coffee'dealefs" licence, _auihorizing the
holderto- = -

(1) buy or deal 1n clean coffee produced
. . in Kenya or to import clean coffee
. f\ffrom outside Kenya and to process,

“in. Kenya. for .local. sale or. export,.
- coffee of any country of ongm and

| (ii)deal in roasting, blendmg and'
- packaging coffee: for local sale or
export, B s

(b) a coffee miller’s: licence authorlzmg the
holder to conduct the business of mlllmg, .

©) a marketmg agent s hcence authorlzmg
the holder. to. conduct the busmess of
marketmg coffee and auctioneering;

(d) a warehouseman’s licence, authorizing
the holder to conduct-the business of
warehousing coffee;




613
2009 Finance

() a pulping station licence, authorizing the’
holder to operate a pulping station.

71. Section 35 of the Persons with Disabil'ities Act, 2003 is

amended by deleting subsection (2) and substituting therefor the_

following new subsection - -

(2) The Minister responsible for finance may, by notice
in the Gazette, prescribe the procedure for application for
and grant of exemption under this section.

72. Section 34 of the Microfinance Act is amended-

(a) Dby inserting the following new subsection immediately
after subsection (3) -

- (3A). 'The Deposit Protection Fund Board and

" institutions licensed . under: this Act shall, in the
ordinary course of business and in such manner and
fo-such extent as the Minister may, in regulations,
prescribe, exchange such information on non
performing loans as may, from time to time, be
specified by the Central Bank in regulations.

(b) in subsection (4) by inserting the word “other”
immediately before the word “information”,

73. Section 48 of the Microfinance Act is amended by

inserting the following new subsection immediately after
subsection (2) -

No. 8 :: :

Amendment

Amendment
of Section 34

of No.19 of

2006.

Amendment
of section 48
of No.19 of
2006.

of section 35 . &
of 14 of 2003,

T A e e o e it S-S ILY A e
L A g A3 o il

rimter

T Y .

B LS




. 614
No. 8 Finance : 2009

(2A) The Central Bank may issue directions and
guidelines to institutions generally for the better carrying
out of their functions, and in particular, with respect to —

(a) the standards to be adhered to in the conduct of their
business in Kenya or in countries where their
branches or subsidiaries are located;

(b) guidelines to be adhered to by institutions in order
to maintain a stable and efficient deposit taking
microfinance system.

Amendment 74. Section 6 of the Kenya Roads Board Act, 1999 is
fosection S o amended in subsection (2)(d) —

(a) by deleting the expression “twenty percent”
appearing at the beginning of paragraph (i) and
substituting therefor the expression “twenty-two
percent, which shall be deposited. into a special
bank account to' be called Constituency Roads
Fund Account to be maintained by every
Constituency;”

(b) deleting the existing paragraph (ii) and
substituting therefor the following —




615

2009 Finance

“(ii) ten percent of the monies from the Fund
is allocated for the maintence or development
of link roads between constituencies and to
serve as Government counterpart funds in
funding - works on rural roads, to be
administered by the Kenya rural Roads
Authority and that the said percentum shall

. be equally distributed to the Constituencies
where Kenya Rural Roads Authority has the
mandate. '

75. The Kenya Roads Board Act is amended by repealing
Section 17 and replacing it with the following new sections -

Establishment; 17.(1) There is hereby established, for every

powers and . .
functions of the constl.tuency,. a committee .tbj be known as the
Constituency Constituency Roads Committee:

roads Committee.

(2) The Constituency Roads Committee
shall comprise.of —

(a) four members from the respective
Constituency Development Fund
Committee;

(b) the Member of Parliament for the
- Constituency;

{¢) arepresentative of the Kenya Rural
Roads Authority in the region, who
shall be the Secretary to the
Committee;,

No. 8

Repeal and
replacement
of section 17
of Act No. 7
of 1999




No. 8

616
F inance 2009

(d) a representatwe from the Mmlstry
: ‘responslble for p_larm_mg,

| (e) the respective District.
Comm1531oner or his
E representatwe and

(B two members co-opted by the
. Comnmittee. .to represent such

- special interests with regard to

. - roads. as. the: committee - may
determme from time: to. time, and

~ who shall not have votmg rights;

(3) ‘The Constituency. Roads Committee-

: shall designate two- of the. members appomted‘

under paragraph (a) of subseetlon (2)to be. the-
Chairman. and Vice Chairman:: of - the
Committee respectlvely, and any . two

‘members from subsection (2)(a) des1gnated by

the Committee and: the. Kenya Rural Roads
Authority accountant shall be the signatories
to: the: Constituency Roads Fund account

g estabhshed by the constituency.

(4) The functlon of the Constituency
roads Committee shall be to advise the Kenya
Rural Roads: Authority on the formulation of
the annual roads programme and the roads to
be mcluded thereln

(5) The Const1tuency Roads Cornm1ttee
shall meet at least four times a year, and a

‘quorum shall comprise of the chairman or

vice-chairman and four other members.




2009

617

Finance

17A. (1y There is hereby established for

“every Constituency a committee to be known as
¢ the Constituency Roads Tender Committee.

"(2): The Constituency. Roads Tender
Committee shall comprise of -~

(a) three representatives of the
Constituency Development
Fund Committee who are
members of the Constituency
Roads Committee;

(b) a representative of the Kenya

Rural Roads Authonty in' the
Region;

(c)  the procurement officer of the
Kenya Rural Roads Authority
in the - region, or his
representative, who shall be the
Secretary.

(3) The membérs of the Constituency
Roads Tender Committee shall appoint two of

- the members referred to in paragraph (2)(a) to

be chairman and vice-chairman of the
Committee respectively:

Provided that the Chairman of the

Constituency Roads Committee shall not be

eligible to be appointed chairman or vice-
chairman of the Constituency Roads Tender
Committee.

No. 8

Establishment,
powers, and
functions of the
Constituency
Roads Tender
Committee,.




No. 8

618
Finance : 2009

(4) The functions of the Constituency
Roads Tender Committee shall be to procure
road works for the Constituency with funds
allocated to the Constituency under this Act.

(5). The quorum shall be the Chairman and
at least three other members of the
Committee.




619
Finance

2009

o

"IoNEW UTUR9MS J3Y10 10 TeSns pappe Sururejuos

10U J0 oYM ‘pnds w%vw wﬁnﬁcau jou pue - pajusuwrpun. ‘soml ynyg oderd Qo . 9§67
| o L “Ianeul maEBouEm 1930 J0 1eSns pappe

0401 SuTuTeIUOS 10U 10 JOURYM ‘inds pappe Surureiuos jou pue pajuduaun ‘omf wnyy adein oIz
S Ia1ew SUTUS1soMS 1110 S Ie3ns

0/01 SuTuTe;uod Jou 0 JYIdYM “Lds pappe Sutureiuos jou pue paewapun ‘oomlafuero 30 0061
0T wﬁnuuoxo 1ou o#.:uw X1iq © JO amﬁmE_quBSBm 1310 10 1eZns vo@.ﬁm wﬁaﬁ.&woo

%01 Jou 10 Joyloym 9nds pappe Surureiuos jou pue pajuSULIANUN ‘wozoy jou doml o8uei) 0TI
“IopeW Butuajooms Bﬁ.o 10 regns nuﬁvm

%01 Buruteluos jou 10 WYRYM “yds pappe Sururejuoo jou pue pajuaurigfun ‘oomnf a3uero wozory  00'[1"

Ang jo sy “uondii3saq spoon ‘oN J]

- J0d1313 AN 9S10XA JO s3je1 pue suondLIossp ‘sioquinu Jyues SULMO[o] a1 3199

119Vd
TINAAHDS HLALA
"TLY dBD 10V SI9XY pUE SWOISN) AU 01 J[NPIYIS YYIJ SY) JO IUAWPUIULY

ATINAAHDS LSUIA

(cs)



620
Finance

2009

No. 8

%01 Surureiuos 1ou 10 I9yIAYM “urds pappe Jumuieiuod jou pue pajusudjun ‘aoinf oydde 1O 0066001
"(0Z SuIpaaoxa j0u 03@, X1Iq B JO ‘Iopeuwl ZuIuajoams J1ajo Jo xedns

%01 pappe Surureluod jou 10 ISygoym ‘jutds pappe Fumureiuod jou pue pajusueun ‘Qoml oiddy 00°1.°600:
“Iopjeul SUTUS}eaMmS 12410 J0 Ie8ns pappe Suruieiuod jou

%01 10 Jaoym ‘Lnds pappe Suturejuod jou pue pajustujun ‘(isnw adeid Gurpnjour) som{ adein 00°69 600"
‘07 SUIP295Xa 10U IN[LA XLIq B JO ‘IONEW SUTU2Ia9Ms 910 10 JeSns pappe Surure;uoo jou

%01 10 1aym “‘nxids pappe Sururejuod jou pue pajusuujun ‘(isnw adeid Surpnyour) 2ol aden 00°19°600
| ‘Toyew SUIus)dams 19110 10 1edns

%01 Poppe SuTUTEIUOD 10U 10 JaUleym ‘uds pappe Sumimeiod jou pue pajusuuyun ‘eoml oyewo], 00°0S°600
peiiidii] quB_ooBm 19110 10 1e8ns pappe mcﬁ_ﬂnoo

%01 ou 10 PeYM ‘unds pappe Surureiuod jou pue pajuswsjun ‘2dmf oiddesuwrd i 00° 6% 600
| ‘07 SuIpadxa Hon anjeA Xuq e Jo ‘1apew w&:&SBm 10430 1o IeSns pappe

%01 Surureinos jou 10 Iaoym JuUIds poppe Surureluod jou pue pajusuudyum ‘soml sddesurg 00 1¥°600
. .uoﬁ._mE BuTuojeaMms 19110 10 Jedns pappe Suruieluod jou 10 IYIUM

%01 “uds pappe Sururejuod jJoU puR PIJUSULIFUM UNI] snn o[duts 1apo Aue Jo a9ml 104310 00°6€°600

0T mﬁwuooxo 10U ,u=H> 5.5 B JO Iopewl SUTa1oams 19110 10 1e3ns pappe Jururejuod Jou
%01 10 IayayMm “yds pappe Sururelno? 10U pue pAIUSULIAJUN UMY St 913urs oo Aue Jo 2omf  00°1€°600
An jo oy ] __ —uondrasa(f spoon “ON JJHT,

(‘pruoD) anpayas is41d



621
No.8

Finance

2009

%01 '$191eM 1910 ], pUE SSWTId] 01°00°¢0€t
%01 Arefwmoronad  00'01°TILT
%01 $981I9A3] JT[OYOITR -UoU 13YIQ 00°06'202T
PAIMOAR]] 10 1)jeWl SUTUSIOIMS ,
001 12110 10 1e3nS Pappe SUIUIRIUOD ‘SISEM PIIBISE PUR SIdfem [BISUIA Surpnjout s1aJe M\ 00012022
%01 nu.ioéa 10U JoyjE BUTUS193MS 3 JO TeFns pappe :
10 31| Moa 9 'SYS SUIUTEIUOD 10U “I9JEMm PIJRIoR PUR SISJeMm [EIUlil [BIdyIIe 10 [emiEu JAYI0 SMOUS pue 30] 00°06° 1022
%01  pomoneyj 1ou mo,zmﬁw SUT2105MS IO 10 JeJns pappe
o u%@ 9'SUS SUTUIEIUO 10U ‘SIAIEM PITRIOR PUR [RISUILL [EIOFIME 10 feimyeu Suiphout siofem [eIauly 00°01° 1022
(-219 saysenbs “sferp10o ‘sdnids g ‘
0401 “§-3) 3012M 1M UonNYIp 2jduuts £q uondumsuoo 10§ Apeal paIspual $981IaA2q POIBIIUAIUO)) 04069012
1apew SuIua}aams IaUl0 10 1e3ns pappe
SUTUIZIU0S JOU 10 1AM uids pappe SUMITEIU0D 10U PUE PAUIULIBIUN ‘SIOM[ JO SAMIKIA 00°06'600C
001 Tl loym JLIds pappe oul mfJ !
"Io1eU SUTUIIMS IS0 10 ieSns pappe Sururejuod 10U 10 19Y1oYMm
%01 quuds pappe SumeIu0d 10U pUR pRAUSULIJUN ‘5qe1952A 10 1y d[3uts 190 Aue Jo I0Inf 00°08 6002
“Iapew SuIu2)aams IS0 10 1e3ns pappe L
A Jo aivy “HONALIISI(J SPOOD ON Jfun ]

(p1102) opayas 1S4



(P110D) a[npaysg 1541,

622
Finance

2009

%01 suoneredaid yeq 1U)0 PUe SIES ﬁB paumyisd 00°0€°L0¢EE
001 sirendsiodyue pue mﬁ.ﬂowouv Teuosing 00°07 LOEE
%01 suoneredord SABYS-191JE 10 UIARYS “3ABYS-31d 00°01°LOEE
0401 aret] uo asn o 107 suoneredaid 19710 00°06'SOEE
0 . . .
Z stonboe[ B 00°0€'SOEE
%01 Treq] Jo SuruaySrens 10 SUIABM jusueutiad 103 suoneredaly 0007 SOEE
%01 soodueg
b soodurey§  00°01°S0EE
mqoﬂ_ﬁ.n_moa e} UNS 10 US2I0SUNS Juipnjout {(SyuouresIpaw
0401 we) JOYI0) UDS S} JO 3180 Y} 0% suoneredaid pure suoneredard dn axyeu 10 fineaq H.oﬁo 00'660€E
%401 osso1dui09 101 ‘S19] | ‘16
P 1109 10U 10 1M s1opmod U0 00° 16 v0EE
%401 suorreredaid amorpad 10 oIOTUIEIN 00°0€+0€€
%01 d -
suoneredaid dn-oxeur oAg 0007 vOEE
%01 suoneredoid dn-axyewr dr]  00°01'H0€E
‘uondiiasa(q speon ‘oN Jjung

(‘p1uoD) anpayos 1S4L{



623
Finance

2009

F e T Rl S

%401 padeys A[y8noi 10 ‘umes A1durts 10 pajIomun 3)LIPUEXI[Y 0Z01°€01L

201 -padeys »szoh 10 ‘umes Ajduris Jo pasjiomun ruezue ], 01°01°€01L

0401 19§ 10 PIAIUNOW J0U ‘PayIoMm ‘SpuowRIp [RLISNPUI-UON 0065 Z201L
198

0401 10 P3IUNOW JOU Inq ‘PINIq I0 PIABI[D &Bmw A1duns Jo pasjIomun ‘Spuowerp [eLISNpUl-uoN 00 1€201L

%01 Spuowreip pauosun] | 00°01°201L

%01 pajIom n_mﬂmom paimymy) 00'CT101L

%001 payI0oMUNn ,mﬁmo_m pamm) 00 ITI0LL

%01 spread [ermeN 00°01°101L
papnjour

%01 10 pa1y10ads 219YyMIs] 10U ‘suoneredaid 191101 10 O1IWSOD ‘poumy1ad 19170 pue souoreidacy 00°06 LOEE
$9)11 Sno131pa1 SuLmp asn

%01 suoneredard snoI1JIOPO Surpnjout ‘suroox guisuopoap 10 Surumrad 103 suoneredaid 10O 00°6¥% LOEE

dimq fo a1vy "UONRALIISI(F SPOOH “ON JJAD]

(po)y) apnpayss 141




( PIUO])) 2[NpaYIS JSA1J

624
Finance

2009

No. 8

-urmumeyd 10 plos Y pareld BZ% SUIpn{OUL JRATIS PIINJoRINUEE TWSS

%01 00°76'901L
%01 ‘tuitiuryerd 10 PloS i paye(d 1PATIS SUIPTIOUL IIALIS WySno1mup) 00'16'901L
%01 “PayIOoM ‘SIUOIS snoroaxd ruas 10 snotoaxd ﬁBoEH.m:ooB_ 10 oﬁoﬁq\nm 10 1Tg) 0006 ¥01L
%01 -ga101s snotoa1d [Was 10 ONIYIUAS padeys A[ySno1 10 umes Ajduuts 10 8%823 19010 00°0TH01L
0401 5a103s $NO1921d TWISS IO STO1DIIA PARONLSUOIIN JO onaquks Suraq zirenb oEoBo-oﬂ..um o.o.oﬁwg L
%401 ‘POYIOM ISIMISYIO (SPUOUIEID et 1Y10) ‘SAU0IS SNO10aId-1as pue SUOIS sno1o21d 19410 0666 €01L
%01 .@.o%o?.oﬁﬁcmxoz 0T'66'€01L
%01 "padIOM “)UEZUE], 01 '66'¢01L
%01 "PIFIOM ISIMIAYIO ‘gprerewa pue saayddes nmoﬁ.n_nm 00 16'€01L
0401 padeys A[ydno1 10 na&mm, memm 10 parjiomun ‘SaU0IS snotoaxd 19MO 06°01°€01L
Ainq jo 210y wondr1osa(J SpocH oN fjuv]




o 0401 L pe}o 10 pateld 10U 10 Joyjoym ‘Te1our aseq Jo Joarom sured pue A13]oMmar Jo STy 00'0T€I1
) ‘ .
2 'STelow snoroaxd 1910 yim
%401 Pe[d 10 paterd 10U 10 10UISYM ‘Terow snowaxd 19Y10 Jo ‘Joatot spred pUe AIS[JaMf JO SO[ONIY 00°61°CI1,
. A "S[e1au snotoard |
%01 13710 M Pe[o 10 P3jed 10U 10 I2IdYM IIATIS JO ‘Joatety syred pue Kmofomar Jo soponry 00 TI°SII,
%01 ‘spunoduwio [ejew snotoaid 1o [g1ow snoroaid Sururejuod ysy 000211,
%401 'PRIMOBIMUBUI LSS UL PIYIOM ISTUTY 10U ‘P[0T YIm PR[o “IAATIS 10 Plog ‘STerow aseq 0000111,
W
O
m ..mn.. %01 PRIMOBINUBT TUISS PUe PasOM Iy 10U ‘PJOS Yim PRIO “IOATIS 10 pjog ‘srerowr aseg 0000601,
& , _
%01 rumuneld i porerd prog Swpnjour) “plod jo sunoy pomioeInuIEW MBS BWO  00°E1°801
%01 Areyouow-uou ‘umunerd wpim parerd pjos Surpnpout ‘p[o3 Jo suwoy JyFnoimun 15y3(0) 0021801,
%01 a0y sopmod ut (umuneid yim parerd plog Bupnjour) pros Amipuowr-uoN 0| 1801,
%01 'PRIMOBINUBI TS UBY} PALOM IOYLINY JOU “IDAJIS YIm wm_o. STelow aseq 00°00°L01;
dmn( fo a0y "HONALIISHT SPooD ‘ON ff1an]
& .
R (‘p1uoD) appayog 1414

e R i S b e ke w1 e



626
2009

Finance

No. 8

%01 "Tesot snowaxd yim pajerd J0u 10 ISYIOYM ‘Terew 3seq 10 Axdf[amaf uoneiur 1990 00°61°L11L

%01 rereur snowaxd gy porerd 10U 10 IAYM ‘[EIoW a5Bq JO ‘Spms pue SYUI| Jn) 00 1T°LITL

001 "(p21onnsu021 10 SNIIUAS ‘[RINIBU) SIU0IS SNOTOaId-TIas 10 sno1oaxd Jo SI[onTy 00°0Z911L

%01 'sfread quBEo 10 feimed JO S3[onTy 00°01°911L

%01 ‘Te1ow snoroaxd 1310 Yiim pepo EBE JO 10 Terowt sno1o31d JO SJITUIR 110 00°06'ST1L
‘sTeow snordaxd 910 Yrm

%01 PEO ‘Te1ow 3seq 110 JO ‘Joaray) sired pue S1eam  SUIIWISISA[IS IO SUIIWS Plog JO So[onry 00°0Z+11L
"S[eIou s101031d I9Y10 Yiim peld 10 paje[d 10U 10 Joym

%01 ‘sTerowr mzosoa 1010 JO ‘Joa1ay} sired pue sIeom SYITWSISAJIS O SIS Pjod J0 sa[onTy 00°61 H11L
"s[e1auI sno1oaid 19410 Yum pepo 1o parerd

%01 10U 10 IOUISYM “ISATIS JO ‘J010Y) Sited pue STeom SUIWISISA[LS 10 SIPIWS P[0 JO SI[ONIY 0011 #11L
‘S[eyout snorodxd

an( fo avy ‘UORALIISI(] SPOOD ‘oN fin ]
(‘pru0D) anpayas iS4




627
No. 8

Finance

2009

& Fr e w T

ani 1ad

%459 10 (7] "SYS syLids "JOA 0408 UeY) SSI] Jo aum[oA £q J1Suans J1{oYofR Ue JO [OYOI[E Ayl cubdwc 13pUn 00°07°807C
a1y 1od o |
049 10 071'SYS "IOY3TY 0 [OA 9408 JO SWN[oA Aq (FUSMS JI[OYOI[L U JO [OY0I[e [AI2 PAIIBU ISPUN) . - 00°01°L0TE
"papn[oul 1o parf1dads a1aymasa jou
an| 1od $¢'sUg a8e10A2q O1{OY0d{E-UOU PUR mommb%n_ POIUSULID] JO SIMIXTW ‘SAFRIIA(] PIJUIULIS] JI() 06°00°90CC
oy 1od ¢ syg (nnqu) 82) 193q anbed( 0C00°90c
anyj 1ad $¢°syg PO 01°00"90¢T
oy 1ad SaMI| 7 Ue) SI0UI JO SI2UIBIUOD Ul
04,(0C 10 O/°SYg SPOUBISqNS ONEOTE IO siueld yum pamoaeyy sadeid ysaiy yons JO UM 12110 PUR YINOULID A 01°06°S0ZT
an 1od SSO[ 10 SAMI[ 7 JO SIAUTBIUOD .
040< 10 ( w.msm ul ‘saoue)sqns onewrore 1o syueld Yiim pamoae(] sadeid ysalj JO oUimM ISYI0 PUe YINOULID A 00°01°S0ZZ
a1y 1ad
%06 10 0L'SYS SuIm st adeld 2O 00°0¢+0TC
anf 1ad SaIji[ 7 UBY} 2I0W JO FuIlrejuod ui Io
040 10 ow.mqm ‘70Y097e JO uonIppe 31 Aq PaISILIR 10 pajuasald uoneudwIa) yim 1snut adeid ‘oum 10q10) 006 0T
any 1ad '$SI[ 10 S| 7 JO SI2UIRIU0D Ul
%4,0S 10 N.mam ‘[OYO3[E JO UONIPPE 3 AQ PIISALIR JO PAJUaAdid UOHBIUSULIY] Yiim Jsnw adeId ‘aum 1010 00°1Z°$0ZC
dm fo awvy HONALIISI(T SPO0D ‘ON Jf1n ]

(PI0D) ajrpayag IS



628
Finance

-

2009

No. 8

*I911eUI UTUS139MS JANI0 10 re8ns pappe Sururejuos

%/ Jou 10 IoUeYm ‘yuids pappe Jurureiuod jou pue pajusuusiun ‘soml ymy oderd romo 00°67°6007
1o Surus1ooms .Sﬁo I0 re3ns vowvm

%l Burureiuos jou 1o 1dyIoYm “inds pappe Surureinos jou pue pawauLgun ‘ool ymyy adein 00' 126007
‘19wl SUTUSIIMS JON10 10 Jedns

%L Surure)uos 10u 10 bﬁuﬂ? E&m voﬁvm Furure)uoo Jou pue pajuswLITun ‘90in( 9fueIo 1B/PO 00°61°600Z
"0 SUIP32OX? J0U dN[BA XUIq  JO ‘I9)ewr SUMISIaaMms JOYI0 Jo esns pappe Suruieiuoo

%L J0u 10 Idyeym Jrds pappe Sulureluod J0U pue PIAUSULIFUN ‘Uazoyy jou domf afueip 00°21°6007
“IopewW SUTU9jR9MmS IRT[0 10 1edns pappe

ol Surureiuos jou 10 1oyIeyMm quds poppe Surureuod 10U pUE pajusULIUN ‘ot agueIo UsZOL] 00°11°600Z

Adm jo a1y “UONALIISI( SPoOD ON JJLDL

~ JoaIaY} AJNp BSI0XA JO $3%81 pue suondiIdsap ‘SIoqUINU JyiIe) SUOT0] oY) HasU]

%01 "IopUs) [e33] Sutaq Jou (U100 Pjo3 el IST10) UI0) 00°01°811,

%01 | A1a][mal uoyerIt 19O 00°06°L11,

anq jo aivy UONALIIS3(T SPOOD - ON Jjun]




Finance No. 8

629

2069

Surarejuoo jou 1o YRYM qunds psppe Sururejuos jou pue pajusuLIafUn ‘9omn{ s1dde 110

%/ 00°6L°600T
"0 SUTPa30XD 10U AM[BA X1IG B JO “IoyeT SUNUSIIMS 150 10 Te3ns
%L, pappe Sururejuod 10 1o 1ayaym ‘unds pappe Surureiuos j0u pue patusuIayun ‘oo ojddy 00° 126007
P mﬁ:ouuogm Iayo 10 Ie3ns pappe Sururejuods jou : .
%/ 10 IotRYMm JLds pappe Sururejuod jou pue pajususyum ‘(jsnw odeid Surpnyour) som( odein) 00°69°6002
"0 SurpaeoXa 10U anfeA Xiq ® Jo ‘Tayews 3uruateams 10710 10 Jedns pappe wﬁﬁﬁgo jou
%l 10 1odYM Juntds pappe Sururejuoo jot pue pajusuLsyum ‘(jsnur aderd Surpnpour) somf adern 00°19°600T
| . “Iopewl SUTUS)29MS IO 10 Iedns
%/ Pappe Sururejuos jou 1o Joyjeym qunds pappe Surureyuoo jou pue pajusunSyUn ‘9omf ojewIo] 00°0$°600T
. | "Io)je SUTUSIOoMS 9110 10 Te3ns pappe Sururenos
%L jou 10 1oqeym ‘unds peppe Sulureiuos jou pue psjusuLISjun ‘9smf opddesuid 1omnQ 00°6+°6007
‘0C wﬁwoooxu 10U 9N[EA XLI] © JO “Io)etu SUT2}9aMs 19410 10 TeSns poppe
04/ Sururejnos jou 1o 19YYM Nitds peppe Surureuos jou pue pajusitoyun “omil syddesur g 00" 1+°6002
 "Iapew Sutuaooms .B.ﬁo 10 1e3ns pappe Surureiuod jou 10 Iapoym
%L Jnds pappe SUMUTEN0D J0U PUE PAJUSULIAMUN IMY Snnlo JBUIS 1Yo Auwe Jo oMl WO 00°6E'600T
"0 SUIP230Xa J0U SNJLA XLIq B JO 1o} SUTUSI0aMS J9Y10 10 TeSns pappe Bumurejuoo jou 10
%) 1Y Lds pappe SUMITEIUod J0U PUR PIIUAULIJUN My snuw (SIS oo Aue Jo somp 00'1£°600Z
anq jo vy _ "UONA1IISI(J SPOoH *ON \\.S__ ' I

(p1uo)) anpaysg 1541



2

(‘prioD) apnpayog 15417

Finance 2009

630

No. 8

amy 1od
94,0 10 om.mnm samm paynio} Jurpnpour ‘sade1d ysax Jo summ Fuippreds 00°01'v0ZT
sy xod $6'SyS el Wolj apew 1939 {0 06°00°€0¢C
sy 1od $sUS J[EW WOLf 3pewl 199q 19p0d pue 101G 01°00°€0TT
%L $93e19A9q ST{OY09J2 -UoU JYIO 00°06202C
P2INOART] 10 JdNeW SUTIOIMS
%L 1310 JO IednS pappe FurTeIU0d ‘SIo1EM PIBISR PUE SITEM [RISUIIA Burpnpout ‘s1are 00°01°202¢C
an1] | MOUS pUR 301 “PAINOARY]
1adoyc 10¢ E.m 10U Iojet SUTtS109MS 1930 1o JeShs pappe SUTureIuod 10U S1ajem [eIOTIIe 10 [emIe 150 00°06° 10T
a1y PAINOAB[J J0U Jo11ew SUMIS)A3MS IOYIO 10
10d 04,c 10 ¢ E.m 1e3ns pappe SuIIILIHOd JOU [BIDIILE 10 [eInjeu JUIPNIOUT ‘SI3)EM PIIRISE pue SIS1eMm [eIoUly 00°01°102C
. 1o71eW SUTUS199MS JAYI0 10 IeSns pappe
%L, SuTuTEIU0S 10U 10 19YIeYM “inds pappe SUTUIRIU0D JOU PUe PIJUSULIGFUN ‘SA0INY JO SIMUXIA 00'06°600T
~ISNRW SUIUSJ29MS IDTI0 10 T3NS Pappe SUTUTeIUOD J0U 10 11aYMm
%L “unds pappe SUUTEIUOS 10U PUR PAIUSULISIUN ‘2[qeIodaA 10 Jmy o18urs 1opo Aue Jo omy 00°08° 600T
: B eI maE.BooBm 19110 10 Ie8ns pappe
dm Jo awwy ‘uond11osa(q spoos oN ffLn]

- (pmo)) apnpayag 1S4




Finance No. 8

631

2009

%G suoneredaid dn-osewt 947 00°0C YOEE
%S suoneredsd dn-oxew m.ﬁ 00°01 H0EE .
046 'SI91eM 1910, PUE SaumLIad 00°00°¢0Le
%S Aqpfwmaronsd  00°01°T1LT
04,59 10 MM.”MMM saferonaq snomyunds 1eto pue siuds BYIO 06°06'80TC
0/,G9 10 MMMMMM (18erep epued() ‘1Beduoy] "3-9) syds pa[SIA  01°06°80CC
%S9 10 MMHMM ‘STeIpIoo pue smanbr]  01°06'302C
%S9 10 M.MMMMM TAPOA 00°09°30¢C
%S9 HO.M.MM_.MMM BAQUSD) puE UL 00°05°80¢¢
04C9 10 MMMMMM s1onpoid sueo redns pajusuwd) Surjnsip Aq paurelqo siuds 19Yj0 pue wny 00°0¥'807Z
%59 10 MMﬁMm SODISTUM,  00°0€'80CC
-arewt adeid 10 oumm adesd urjnstp Aq paureiqo
An fo amwy ‘UONANIS2(] SPOOD) .

(p1102) anpatss 1S4

ON Jf1nx



632
Finance

2009

No. 8

%S

S sno1difax Juump pasn

suoneredaxd snoxeyuopo Sutpnjout ‘swool Sutstroposp 10 Furumyiad 10§ suoneredaid &1 T

00°6¥°L0CE
04S suoyeredaid yeq 1oqi0 pue sifes yeq paumjag 00°0€ LOSE
04C suenidsiadyue pue sjueropoap H:oﬂmm 00'0Z°L0SE
4G T suorreredsrd aaeys-1aye 1o Fuiarys ‘DABYS-21] 00°01°L0S€ -
%C Ireq uo asn ayp 0] suoijeredad 1o 00°06°SO<E
%C sonboel ey 00"0€S0ES
04C 1req jo Sutusyy3rens 10 Suiaem Justeuriad 1oy suoneredarg 00°07°S0<E
%S soodureqys  00°01°S0EE
suorreredaid we} uns 1o uaa10stMS uUTpNdUT ‘(SIUSWERIIPIU
%S Ueq) 13Y10) UTYS 343 3O 3180 311 10§ suoneredsrd pue suoneredard dn ayew 10 Aneaq 1210 00°66 YOS
0%4C passa1dwod 10U 1o 1yIayMm ‘s1apmod 1910y 00° 16 +0€€
0%C suoneredaid amoipad 10 amonuepy 00°0€ $0€S
dm Jo sy ‘UONIA1IISI(] SPOOD) | ON ffro g

(P1102) anpayos IS4ty




633
Finance

NO- "*3

2009

%C9 10 anI|
1ad 9Z1'sYs

%06 10
any| 12d o/ 'sYS

%06 10
211 3od 0/ "SYS

"I9Y3IY 10 [OA 94,08 JO aum[oA Aq |Suons ST[OYOE Ue JO [010d[e JAYIo pamyeuspul)

: SaI] T UeY) 9I0W JO SISUIBIUOD
Enmooqﬂmnsmoﬁm&oahoSqm_mﬁ_svﬁzo%@momm%amowﬁsm mooguuﬁowamﬁ:ogo\w

$S3[ I0 SaMI[ 7 JO SISUTRIUOD
1 ‘saouejsqus onewore 1o syueld ym pamoAe]} sadexs gsaly Jo ouwm ISYI0 pUR IPNOULD A

%08 10

o 1ad g/ 'sYS

%06 10
any 1ed 0L 'sys

%0 10
I RERR TN (N
%05 10
o 12d 0£'SYS

%01

sum 1snt aderd roy)

SomI] ¢ Uety) a10w Jo SUIILIN0D Uy
10 JOY0o[e JO UCTIPPE oY) Aq PajsaLe 10 pajuarard UOTRIUSULIS] M Istutt oderd ‘oumm 1oy

"$59] JO SaI1] 7 JO SISUTEIU00
Ut “[0Y03[e JO UONTPPE 31} AQ PAISILIE 10 PojusAaId UOTRIUSULISY YIMm jsnu aderd ‘oum 19710

SauLM paynuoy 3urpnpout ‘sadeid ysaiy yo summ Fuppredg

(910 sa[qqenbs ‘sperp1os ‘sdnifs -
3'9) 1o1em yim wonnyip sduns Aq wondumsuos 10J Apea1 palopuai safersnaq parenuaduo))

00°01°L0TT

01°06°S0C¢

00°01°S0T¢

00°0€¥0ZZ

00°6T+0CC

00°12'+v0CC

00°01%0¢CC

0L°06901C

"Ayp 9s19%3 Jo saje1 Butpuodsarioo a1y pue suonduosap ‘sroqumu JJure) JuImMOo[[of a1 9913 VT

(prioD) agnpayog 1541,y



2009

634
Finance

0459 10 21
12d 0Z1°sUS
%S9 10 9]
12d 0Z1°SUS
94,G9 J0 2111
1ad QZ1°sUS
%4$9 10 27|
1d OZ1'SUS
0459 10 o1
12d Q7 1SUS
04,59 10 2]
12d QZ1°SUS
%59 10 9]
12d QZ1°SUS

04,69 0 311
12d 9Z1°SUS

sofe19A2q SnomLIdS 1310 pue synds 190
(18erep BpUES() “13ekuoy] 82) siuds pafnsiq
g[etp109 pue smanbry

eXPOA

BASULLD) pUB UID)

-syonpoid sued redns payuouia] Furpmstp Aq paureqo siunds 1310 puB Wiy -

"SODISTUAN

srewt odexd 10 summ adeid Suiusip Aq paurelqo
syuds “JOA 0408 W} SS3 JO sum(oa Aq Giduans 1oYooTe Ue JO [0YOITE TAq1o parmjeuapuy)

(o)) aprpayds 1S44

06°06"80CC

01°06'80CC

01°06'80CC

00°09°80C¢C

00°0S"80CC

00°0¥%'80CC

00°0¢£'80CC

00°0T'80CC



635
Finance

2009

%S € 10 any

1d gz1sus
%S 10 AN

12d OZ1°SUS

%S€ 10

aniy 1od (£'sYS

%S¢ 10

a1 12d OL'SYS

%S¢ 10

aniy 12d 0/'sYS

%S¢ 10

anij 1od (/'sYS

%S¢ 10

anig 1ad (£'sYS

%S¢ 10

an| 12d 0L 'SYS

%ol

sLiids '[0A 94,08 el $$3] Jo Sumjoa £q I3UANS JI[OYOI[R Ue JO [OY0d[e [AID cogmmovad

"IOUSTY 10 "JOA 940§ JO SUM[OA Aq (PBUSNS ST[OYOITE UE JO [OYOI[R [AYIS paInjeuapu)

SaM|  Uey) SI0W FuIpjoy SISUTRIUOD UI
‘s30uEISqus onewore 1o syue[d M pamoar]] sadeid ysaiy yons Jo sUIA ISYI0 PUB NOULIOA

$S31 10 SoXI] 7 SUIP[OY JO SISUTBIUOD
U ‘sa0urIsqns ouewWore 1o sjuerd ym @oSo%m sade1d ysaij Jo summ ISUPO puUR YPNOULID A

snuwr adeI3 110

a1 7 Ueyl a10w Surpjoy s1surejuos

Ul ‘[OYoJ[e JO UONIPPE 3 AQ PRISILIE 10 pajuaAdid uoneueuLa) im jstw odeid ‘oumm uoﬁo

'S89[ 10 sa11| T 3uIploy JO S1suTRIU0D
ur ‘[oY0d]e JO UOIPPE aU) Aq voﬁoﬁa 10 pajuaAa1d uoTrIUAULISY Yim Isnuu odeid fourm 1oy

saum parnzoy Surpnyout ‘sadeid ysaiy jo sum Surpyreds

papnpout 1o woﬁumam Ho%ﬁoﬂo j0u suoneredaid pooj 1910

00°07°80TC

00°01°L0CT
01°06'S0ZT
00°01°S02T
00°0§+07C

00°6C ¥0CC

00:12+0¢CC

00°01+0TC

06'06'901C

"AInp 9519%2 JO sajex Furpuodsariod oy pue suondLosap s1aqumu Jjure) SUIMO[[Of oY) UasU] ‘g7

(‘pruoD) ampayog 1841



Finance 2009

636

"No. 8

"anyeA

S1qESIOXS I JO %01 JO 9781 3y3 Je AP 3STOX PAZIeYd 3q [[eys SA01AIS suoyda[a) SSA[EIM IO ‘¢

%S¢ 10 21|
13d (Z1°sYS

- %G ¢ I0 any
- 3d 0Z1°sYS

%G¢ 10 am1]
1d 0Z1°sYs
%S¢ 10 211]
1d 0Z1°sYS
%S¢ 10 any
1d 0Z1°sYS
%S € 10 oI
1ed oZ1°sYS
%S¢ 10 a1
1d gz1°sys

"anJeA S]qESIOXd 11911 JO %01 JO 5181 oY Je A1np as10%3 padreyp aq [[eys S301ATSS Suoyd Ie[n{[ad S[IQON 7

a1 1od G§'SUS 2q [[BYS LW WO SPEuT 10U 192q 1O Anp astoxyg |

“[I1 37ed M3U UIMO[[0] 3} W3S pue []] 1red Sunisrxa oy ajo[(

sa8e1aAaq snomruds 1atpo pue sunds 1smQ

(13erep epuedn “1Bekuoy 3-0) syuds pausiq

"STe1pI0d pue smanbi

BYPOA

BASUSY) PUE UIN)

's1onpouxd sues redns payusuusy Surmusip Aq paureiqo sjunds a0 pue wmyy
"SATYSTY M

"orewr adeid 10 summ oderd Surpmsip 4q paureiqo

("PIU0oN) ampayoQ 15417

06°06'80CC

01°06°80CC

00°0L780TC

00°09°80T¢C

00°05°80CC

00°0¥'80CC

00°0€£°80CT



®
]
Z

637
Finance

2009

(p1140D) apnpayog 5.4 &

"%ST JO 21ex oy e Kinp
dwos pasn pauodun [y -y



a - [z ydesSered 1oy5e Ajorerpaurut ydeigered mau JuImo[[O] oY1 LaSU[ ‘Y
[ -
ol
"UONPULIOJU] 10 JqIsuocdsal
1staijA] ) £q paaoidde 19onpoid Il B 0] SIJIAIIS S[qEXE] pUE spoo3 s1qexel Jo Ajddns auJ, "1
. *K13190§G SS01))
Py BAUSY 01 SITIAISS S[qeXE] PUB ‘SIIIYIA 10j0U Furpnyour ‘spoo3 sjqexey Jo Addns ayjy 0z
-amyoudy Jo 1019211(J U} Aq [eaoxdde
uodn sO[IS UreId Jo UOTIONIISUOD Y} UT 3N 10J SITAIIS J[qexe] 10 SPOOS S[qeXe) JO Aiddns a4 '61
3 — g1 ydeigered tayye Ajoyerpaurnut sydeidered mou Surmofjof a3 195Uy °¢
8 £ " SO0
uonone 831, SPIoM Uy IaJe A[9jerpsunu  Jodxa J0J ST 937309 10 B33 9 papraoad sa1jusd uondNe Y}
wo1] 1ySnoq 993303 1o B Jo 10adsax ut sarjddns ojqexe) pue,, Sp1om 3y Suniasur £q g ydeidered puswy g
-_s1op10dxa,, pIom 31 210J2q A[SIRIPSUIL  PaYAZES,, SPIOM Y} BurlIasul Aq 9 ydeidered pusury 1
V 1LYVvd
ATNAAHDS HLATA
(‘9Ly "deD 19V Xe], PSPPV M[eA
I~ a1 01 ANPIYIS YL Y} JO JUSWPUIUTY)
S
. Z

e | AINATHIS ANODIS




Burpa20xa 10U PISUI] € JO PUB WIWCE mcﬁuouxo Hon ﬁﬁ oot &
& Jo (swoiAtod) yder3ojoyd mojoo 10§ muEAE 16 ﬁmmﬂ

1310 JeLdyew Aue Jo ‘pasodxaun ‘PaznISuss §yjor uo.ﬁm_up _

S o0psToLs

! "00°ESTOLE
"W FuIpasdxa YSudy v jo pue Eﬁwm ST
e Jo (dwoipyoLyod) ydeidojoyd anojos 101 muﬁxﬁ 10 Eﬁi
110 [euewW Aue JO ‘pasodxaun ‘paziisuss ‘s[[o1 uo EE 3 L.w 00°7S°20LE
"Wy | SuIpa3oxa jou yfua) v Jo pue Eﬁwm 33
e Jjo (dwoiyaAjod) yderdoroyd mojos 1og *Sax3) 10 m !
m I3Y10 [eLdlew Aue Jo womomxocz ‘pazmisuas ¢ m:oH uo EE Jﬁmﬂa 00°'1S'ZOLE
L aqmmgﬂn,bfu 3 ‘oN ffiang
-Joaray; stonduosap sy pur s1oqunu e mﬁﬁomomuﬁ .5@5 [EOLISWINY 13y UT 119SU]
q19vd
‘sdrys o3 m_ou_i.mm_.mﬂmwﬁ jo Ajddns ay7 ‘77
)
=
o]

(‘piuo)) ANPAYIS PU09Ig




(‘P1U0D) S[NPAYIS PU0IS

a "SBISWED I0] SOLIOSSOOR PUE SHred 00°16°9006
S U £¢ Jo q1pim e Jo Ul [0l 107 selalred B3 00°£$°9006
"s190npal 10 s1ogreud orydeidooyd 10 s10393{oad ‘seroured 10] sasua] 00'11'2006
“PASLIOION }0U ‘(SI[2AILN AISAT[SP SUIPN[OUT) SI[IAD I9YI0 PUB SI[0AIIY 00°00'CI.S
'SIOPI0III BISUIED OSPIA PUR SBRISUIRD [BUJIP ‘SBISUIeD UOISIAD]R], 00°08°SZSS
syas Sunersusd 10M0 00°6£°Z0S8
sjes Bunerousd paromod puip 00'1£°Z0SS
somBus uoystd uonsnquios Tewisu wonTudr yreds im sies SunrIsusn 00°0Z°20S8
VAN S.¢€ Surpasoxa indino ue Jo 388 Sunieisusn 00°€1°20S8
VA S€ Surpasoxs jou ng YA Y ¢/ Surpasoxa jndino ue s19s Juneisusn 00°Z21°20S8
VA 2 upasoxs jou mndino Jo s19s Suneiousn 00°11°20S8
3 MG/ € Surpaaoxa mdino ue Jo s10jeIdUa3 D 00'¥£°10S8
o 5 MG/ € SUTPaadX? 10U INq MYG/ SUIpaadxa ndino ue Jo S101e19Ua3 D( 00°€€° 1058
3 m MG/ SuIpadoxad J0U Ing M(S/ SUIpaaoxa ndino ue Jo s10jeIduad (I 00°Z€° 1058
MQS/ 3urpa9aoxa jou ndino Ue JO SI0YRIdUT D 00°1€° 1058
‘smeredde qoamooo.ﬁ Sunerodioout smeredde voisstsuel |, 00°09°6ZS8
-snyeredde uoisstwsuer], 00°0$°SZS8
*1I9UN) 03PIA
e Sunelodiosur jou 10 1oq1aym smeredde Suronpoidal 10 Furpieoar 09pIA 1910 00°06° 1258
wog
Burpo2oxa P3us] © JO pUB WUIGE JUIPIIOXS J0U Inq W9 Furpasoxa {Ipm
® Jo (swoipyoAjod) ydeigojoyd moyod 10§ {$3nxa) 10 preoqieded ‘raded ueip
1910 TeuSYeW AUR Jo ‘pasodxaun paznisuas ‘sqjor wo wiry omderdoroyd 1oyip 00°SS Z0LE
"SOPI[S 10] ULy} I9Y)0 W(E
M uondrosaq [l ON S
4

£ PIToYY ATNATIAC DIHAAC




641

No. §

Finance

2009

_. _ﬁ::notwn: SpIom a1 1o)e bﬂm‘_vu&g SWed pue; piom oty Surisosin Aq 11 ydeiSered uy - m

‘ydeiSered oy jo ey uﬁ 1e Suireadde _stoien

| “(SIo3ue] y[1w pajernsur
pue SYOoNI uoI99}j0d 2FeqIed ‘syony pate1dgLyal 9run [ear30101pel ofiqow ‘sdoysyiom o
orqowr ‘saturo] Burkeids ‘soriIog umopea1q sjdurexa 10y) spood 1o suosiod Jo wodsuen -

Y} 10y paugisap Ajjediouid ssoy wey 1oto "sa1o1yaA 1010w asodind [edads LMo 71

~ 1 ydesdered mou wﬁm&_z& o Sunasur pue 71 ydeiSered w:s.ﬂxo oy Sunsjeq ‘7

| .zuuﬁ.o: pIom o Funepep Aq ¢ ydesFered uy -y
 SU00D AALVY O¥aZ

'sqnq yse[j pue ﬁw&&%%@ sryder3oroyd rayi 00°69°9006

. : e . sadoosoredau ‘satioreroqey . .
(orydedorewouro Surpnyour) swydedoioyd 10 1esaxdmba pue snjeredde 12710 00050106
e 0 wopduoasaq ffimy | oN ffimg

(‘1o 54 E0G PUOSag




642

2009

Finance

-uopoo pauutd pue pasnpoid A[[ed0T 9T

_ ¢z ydegered 1oye ydeiSered mou e Juippe A9 ‘¥

("p1uoD) AMPAYIS PU0IS

No. 8




642
Finance

=2}
3

No. 8

-uon09 pouuld pue paonpoid A[[ed0T 9T

— ¢z ydeiSered 1o1e deiSeied mau e Suippe A ¥

("pruo)) IMPIYIS PUORY



